
 
 
 

City of Kingston
Kingston Heritage Properties Committee

Agenda
 

 

Wednesday, September 18, 2024
9:30 a.m.

Council Chamber

Committee Composition

Councillor Glenn, Chair
Councillor Oosterhof

Jennifer Demitor
Peter Gower

Gunnar Heissler
Alexander Legnini
Jane McFarlane

Daniel Rose
Ann Stevens

Please provide regrets to Iain Sullivan, Committee Clerk at 613-546-4291,
extension 1864 or isullivan@cityofkingston.ca
Watch live on the Kingston City Council YouTube channel or register to receive the Zoom link.

Pages

1. Call to Order

2. Approval of the Agenda

3. Confirmation of Minutes

That the minutes of Kingston Heritage Properties Committee Meeting Number
09-2024, held Wednesday, August 21, 2024, be approved. 

4. Disclosure of Pecuniary Interest

5. Delegations

6. Briefings

7. Business

1. Pre-Consultation

2. Policy Development and Implementation

mailto:isullivan@cityofkingston.ca
https://www.youtube.com/%40KingstonCityCouncil/featured
https://us06web.zoom.us/webinar/register/WN_NltPqWJJSGW-xUYc-LeUzQ


3. Stream Two Permits - Approval through Delegated Authority

4. Stream Three Permits - Approval Through Council Authority

1. Application for Ontario Heritage Act Approval - 9 George Street 7

The Report of the Commissioner of Community Services (HP-
24-038) is attached. 

Recommendation: 

That the Kingston Heritage Properties Committee supports
Council's approval of the following: 

That alterations to the property at 9 George Street, be
approved in accordance with details as described in the
application (P18-084-2024), which was deemed complete
on August 7, 2024 with said alterations to include the
installation/construction of a second floor addition above
an existing one storey addition, a new porch that faces
Wellington Street, a new carport over the existing
driveway, a new approximately 0.3 metre raised
foundation clad in limestone, new windows/surrounds/trim
and doors for all openings, new standing seam profile
roofing with skylights, new wood siding/trim for the entire
building, new window openings on the vestibule and east
elevation, two new decks that face the rear yard, and the
removal of the existing chimney and two first floor
windows on the western elevation; and

That the approval of the application is subject to the
conditions outlined in Exhibit A to Report Number HP-24-
038.

5. Notice of Intention to Designate under the Ontario Heritage Act

1. 294 Elliot Ave, 3751 Smith Rd, 3867 Smith Rd, 722-766 John
Counter Blvd, 831 Montreal St, 1901 Jackson Mills Rd, 262
Wellington Street, 2973 Orser Rd, 4226 Florida Rd, 617-619
Union St, and 79-83 Princess St.

104

The Report of the Commissioner of Community Services (HP-
24-039) is attached. 

Recommendation: 

That Kingston Heritage Properties Committee recommends to
Council: 

That Council direct staff to serve a Notice of Intention to
Designate the property located at 294 Elliott Avenue,
known as the Elliott Farmhouse, as a property of cultural
heritage value or interest pursuant to Section 29 of the
Ontario Heritage Act, attached as Exhibit A to Report
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Number HP-24-039; and

That should no Notice of Objection be received by the
Clerk of The Corporation of the City of Kingston within
thirty (30) days of the publication of the Notice of Intention
to Designate, the Designation By-Law for 294 Elliott
Avenue, known as the Elliott Farmhouse, attached as
Exhibit B to Report Number HP-24-039, be presented to
Council for all three readings, and that staff be directed to
carry out the requirements as prescribed under Section
29(8) of the Act; and

That Council direct staff to serve a Notice of Intention to
Designate the property located at 3751 Smith Road,
known as the Bell Farmstead, as a property of cultural
heritage value or interest pursuant to Section 29 of the
Ontario Heritage Act, attached as Exhibit A to Report
Number HP-24-039; and

That should no Notice of Objection be received by the
Clerk of The Corporation of the City of Kingston within
thirty (30) days of the publication of the Notice of Intention
to Designate, the Designation By-Law for 3751 Smith
Road, known as the Bell Farmstead, attached as Exhibit C
to Report Number HP-24-039, be presented to Council for
all three readings, and that staff be directed to carry out
the requirements as prescribed under Section 29(8) of the
Act; and

That Council direct staff to serve a Notice of Intention to
Designate the property located at 3867 Smith Road,
known as the Smith Farmstead, as a property of cultural
heritage value or interest pursuant to Section 29 of the
Ontario Heritage Act, attached as Exhibit A to Report
Number HP-24-039 and

That should no Notice of Objection be received by the
Clerk of The Corporation of the City of Kingston within
thirty (30) days of the publication of the Notice of Intention
to Designate, the Designation By-Law for 3867 Smith
Road, known as the Smith Farmstead, attached as Exhibit
D to Report Number HP-24-039, be presented to Council
for all three readings, and that staff be directed to carry
out the requirements as prescribed under Section 29(8) of
the Act; and

That Council direct staff to serve a Notice of Intention to
Designate the property located at 722-766 John Counter
Boulevard, known as the John Elliott Farmhouse, as a
property of cultural heritage value or interest pursuant to
Section 29 of the Ontario Heritage Act, attached as Exhibit
A to Report Number HP-24-039; and
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That should no Notice of Objection be received by the
Clerk of The Corporation of the City of Kingston within
thirty (30) days of the publication of the Notice of Intention
to Designate, the Designation By-Law for 722-766 John
Counter Boulevard, known as the John Elliott Farmhouse,
attached as Exhibit E to Report Number HP-24-039, be
presented to Council for all three readings, and that staff
be directed to carry out the requirements as prescribed
under Section 29(8) of the Act; and

That Council direct staff to serve a Notice of Intention to
Designate the property located at 831 Montreal Street, as
a property of cultural heritage value or interest pursuant to
Section 29 of the Ontario Heritage Act, attached as Exhibit
A to Report Number HP-24-039; and

That should no Notice of Objection be received by the
Clerk of The Corporation of the City of Kingston within
thirty (30) days of the publication of the Notice of Intention
to Designate, the Designation By-Law for 831 Montreal
Street, attached as Exhibit F to Report Number HP-24-
039, be presented to Council for all three readings, and
that staff be directed to carry out the requirements as
prescribed under Section 29(8) of the Act; and

That Council direct staff to serve a Notice of Intention to
Designate the property located at 1901 Jackson Mills
Road, known as the Jackson Mill, as a property of cultural
heritage value or interest pursuant to Section 29 of the
Ontario Heritage Act, attached as Exhibit A to Report
Number HP-24-039; and

That should no Notice of Objection be received by the
Clerk of The Corporation of the City of Kingston within
thirty (30) days of the publication of the Notice of Intention
to Designate, the Designation By-Law for 1901 Jackson
Mills Road, known as the Jackson Mill, attached as Exhibit
G to Report Number HP-24-039, be presented to Council
for all three readings, and that staff be directed to carry
out the requirements as prescribed under Section 29(8) of
the Act; and

That Council direct staff to serve a Notice of Intention to
Designate the property located at 262 Wellington Street,
as a property of cultural heritage value or interest pursuant
to Section 29 of the Ontario Heritage Act, attached as
Exhibit A to Report Number HP-24-039; and

That should no Notice of Objection be received by the
Clerk of The Corporation of the City of Kingston within
thirty (30) days of the publication of the Notice of Intention
to Designate, the Designation By-Law for 262 Wellington
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Street, attached as Exhibit H to Report Number HP-24-
039, be presented to Council for all three readings, and
that staff be directed to carry out the requirements as
prescribed under Section 29(8) of the Act; and

That Council direct staff to serve a Notice of Intention to
Designate the property located at 2973 Orser Road,
known as the Orser Farmstead, as a property of cultural
heritage value or interest pursuant to Section 29 of the
Ontario Heritage Act, attached as Exhibit A to Report
Number HP-24-039; and

That should no Notice of Objection be received by the
Clerk of The Corporation of the City of Kingston within
thirty (30) days of the publication of the Notice of Intention
to Designate, the Designation By-Law for 2973 Orser
Road, known as the Orser Farmstead, attached as Exhibit
I to Report Number HP-24-036, be presented to Council
for all three readings, and that staff be directed to carry
out the requirements as prescribed under Section 29(8) of
the Act; and

That Council direct staff to serve a Notice of Intention to
Designate the property located at 4226 Florida Road,
known as the Walker Farmstead, as a property of cultural
heritage value or interest pursuant to Section 29 of the
Ontario Heritage Act, attached as Exhibit A to Report
Number HP-24-039; and

That should no Notice of Objection be received by the
Clerk of The Corporation of the City of Kingston within
thirty (30) days of the publication of the Notice of Intention
to Designate, the Designation By-Law for 4226 Florida
Road, known as the Walker Farmstead, attached as
Exhibit J to Report Number HP-24-039, be presented to
Council for all three readings, and that staff be directed to
carry out the requirements as prescribed under Section
29(8) of the Act; and

That Council direct staff to serve a Notice of Intention to
Designate the property located at 617-619 Union Street,
as a property of cultural heritage value or interest pursuant
to Section 29 of the Ontario Heritage Act, attached as
Exhibit A to Report Number HP-24-039; and

That should no Notice of Objection be received by the
Clerk of The Corporation of the City of Kingston within
thirty (30) days of the publication of the Notice of Intention
to Designate, the Designation By-Law for 617-619 Union
Street, attached as Exhibit K to Report Number HP-24-
039, be presented to Council for all three readings, and
that staff be directed to carry out the requirements as
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prescribed under Section 29(8) of the Act; and

That Council direct staff to serve a Notice of Intention to
Designate the property located at 79-83 Princess Street,
known as the Robert White Building, as a property of
cultural heritage value or interest pursuant to Section 29 of
the Ontario Heritage Act, attached as Exhibit A to Report
Number HP-24-039; and

That should no Notice of Objection be received by the
Clerk of The Corporation of the City of Kingston within
thirty (30) days of the publication of the Notice of Intention
to Designate, the Designation By-Law for 79-83 Princess
Street, known as the Robert White Building, attached as
Exhibit L to Report Number HP-24-039, be presented to
Council for all three readings, and that staff be directed to
carry out the requirements as prescribed under Section
29(8) of the Act.

6. Working Groups

7. Permit Approvals / Status Updates

1. September 2024 194

8. Motions

9. Notices of Motion

10. Other Business

11. Correspondence

12. Date of Next Meeting

The next meeting of the Kingston Heritage Properties Committee is scheduled
for Wednesday, October 16, 2024 at 9:30 a.m. 

13. Adjournment
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